



Unofficial Copy

Naperville Park District™

BID RESULTS

CONTRACT MOWING SERVICE 2024 WITH OPTION TO RENEW IN 2025 AND 2026 BID OPENING THURSDAY, JANUARY 25, 2024 AT 9:45AM

NORTH REGION						
Company Name	2024: Price Per Acre Per Week	2024: Total Based on 22.82 Acres Per Week for 30 Weeks	2025: Price Per Acre Per Week	2025: Total Based on 22.82 Acres Per Week for 30 Weeks	2026: Price Per Acre Per Week	2026: Total Based on 22.82 Acres Per Week for 30 Weeks
Mark1 Landscape	\$ 34.79	\$ 23,820.00	\$ 35.01	\$ 23,970.00	\$ 35.98	\$ 24,630.00
Havenshine Technologies, Inc.	\$ 51.60	\$ 35,325.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

CENTRAL REGION						
Company Name	2024: Price Per Acre Per Week	2024: Total Based on 40.53 Acres Per Week for 30 Weeks	2025: Price Per Acre Per Week	2025: Total Based on 40.53 Acres Per Week for 30 Weeks	2026: Price Per Acre Per Week	2026: Total Based on 40.53 Acres Per Week for 30 Weeks
Mark1 Lanscape	\$34.79	\$42,300.00	\$34.99	\$42,540.00	\$36.00	\$43,770.00
Havenshine Technologies, Inc.	\$44.40	\$53,986.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

SOUTH REGION						
Company Name	2024: Price Per Acre Per Week	2024: Total Based on 43.7 Acres Per Week for 30 Weeks	2025: Price Per Acre Per Week	2025: Total Based on 43.7 Acres Per Week for 30 Weeks	2026: Price Per Acre Per Week	2026: Total Based on 43.7 Acres Per Week for 30 Weeks
Mark1 Landscape	\$ 34.81	\$ 45,630.00	\$ 35.01	\$ 45,900.00	\$ 36.00	\$ 47,190.00
Havenshine Technologies, Inc.	\$ 39.00	\$ 51,129.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

Witness: John D. Teper
 Witness: Tristin Toures